
A.  Industrial Electrical - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up A.  Industrial Electrical - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up

Licensed 
Journeyman Apprentice

Licensed 
Journeyman Apprentice

Licensed 
Journeyman Apprentice

Licensed 
Journeyman Apprentice

Licensed 
Journeyman Apprentice

Licensed 
Journeyman Apprentice

70.00$           50.00$                   105.00$          75.00$           105.00$        75.00$          3 35% 85 90.00$           -$              135.00$           -$               180.00$         -$              90.00$                   20% 90.00$                 

B.  Instrumental and Controls - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up B.  Instrumental and Controls - Hourly Rates and Parts Mark-up

NO BID 125.00$               20%  $            125.00 

C.  Electricians C.  Electricians
Number of Master Electricians currently employed by your company 1 Number of Master Electricians currently employed by your company 2
Number of licensed journeyman electricians currently employed by your company 2 Number of licensed journeyman electricians currently employed by your company 2
Number of licensed apprentice electricians currently employed by your company 2 Number of licensed apprentice electricians currently employed by your company 0

No Yes

No No

Net 30 - No discount 

Prices based on Co-Op:

C I T Y   O F   S A N   A N G E L O 

BID TABULATION * RFB NO: WU-10-19/ 2019 Industrial Electrical* July 10, 2019 2PM

Prices based on Co-Op:

187.50$                                 

Hourly Rate Weekends & 
Holidays (Technician)

Bidder's 
Minimum Charge 
$'s and/or Hours

NO BID 125.00$                              250.00$                              NO BID

Bidder's 
Minimum Charge 
$'s and/or Hours

Parts Mark-
up %

Technician & 1 
Helper

Parts Mark-
up %

Vendor: Mike Verfurth Electric

Regular Hourly Rate Overtime Hourly Rate
Hourly Rate Weekends & 

Holidays Bidder's 
Minimum Charge 
$'s and/or Hours

Parts Mark-
up %

Average 
price/Hr 1 

Journeyman & 1 
Helper

Technician & 1 
Helper

Regular Hourly Rate  
(Technician)

Regular Hourly Rate  
(Technician)

Overtime Hourly Rate  
(Technician)

Vendor: Bunyard Hasty Electric Inc.

Bidder's 
Minimum Charge 
$'s and/or Hours

Parts Mark-
up %

Average 
price/Hr 1 

Journeyman & 1 
Helper

Regular Hourly Rate

Allows Piggy-Back Procurment:

Payment Terms/Discount:

Overtime Hourly Rate
Hourly Rate Weekends & 

Holidays

NO BID

Hourly Rate Weekends & 
Holidays (Technician)

NO BID

Overtime Hourly Rate  
(Technician)

Allows Piggy-Back Procurment:

Payment Terms/Discount:


